
Did you know February is
American Heart Month? With
Valentine’s Day approaching, i t ’s
the perfect t ime to be thinking
about heart health! Here are some
heart-related items to keep in
mind.

Heart disease is the leading cause
of death in the United States.  This
is also true for the state of Kansas,
where heart disease leads al l
causes of death. Making healthy
l i festyle choices can help to
prevent heart disease. Two of
these choices include eating a
healthy diet and being physical ly
active. The former is essential
because poor dietary qual i ty is
the top r isk factor for heart
disease, accounting for
approximately half  of heart
disease deaths worldwide. The
American College of Cardiology
and the American Heart
Associat ion have identif ied
several diet recommendations
related to heart health.  This
includes fol lowing a diet which
emphasizes eating vegetables,
fruits,  legumes, nuts,  whole
grains, and f ish. They also
recommend choosing foods lower
in sodium and cholesterol ,
replacing saturated fats with
unsaturated fats ( l ike cooking with 
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vegetable oi l  instead of butter),
and avoiding sweetened
beverages.

In addit ion to eating a heart-
healthy diet,  being physical ly
active is also key to promoting
heart health.  The Physical Activity
Guidel ines for Americans
recommend that adults get at
least 150 minutes of moderate-
intensity aerobic activity each
week. These guidel ines also
recommend doing muscle-

strengthening activit ies on at least
two days per week. However,  i f
this is more than you can do r ight
now, focus on doing what you
can. Even just f ive minutes of
physical activity can have health
benefits!

There are many tools out there
which can help you to make
healthy choices regarding diet
and exercise, including MyPlate,
the Nutr it ion Facts label ,  and
more. Learning how to use these
tools to improve your health and
potential ly reduce your health
care costs wi l l  be the focus of a
free class I  am teaching at the
LaHarpe City Hal l  on Saturday,
February 26th at 1 PM. For more
information about this class and
other steps you can take to
prevent heart disease, please
contact me at
clarawicoff@ksu.edu or 620-365-
2242.

Making healthy
l i festyle choices
can help to
prevent heart
disease. Two of
these choices
include eating a
healthy diet and
being physical ly
active.


